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products. I recently did a Reaktor 4
demonstration for red bull in Detroit,
and discussed how NI products and
technology is changing the music
industry. Native Instruments
technology will save and reinvent
electronic music from Detroit. Mark
my word. I am on a mission personally
to demonstrate this.

Will you be doing more events for
Native instruments?  What is next on
your agenda? 

I do several Native Instrument
demonstrations throughout Detroit on
a regular basis. You can catch some at
record time, and several other
locations throughout Detroit. I plan on
doing lots of producing.  Native
Instruments software has reshaped
my creative process, and has taught
me things correctly. In other words,
I’m ready!

Do you have a website where people
can listen to some of your mixes?

For more info please visit

www.pthf.net. 

You can also check out my own web
site, for more info on me, and my
newly launched recording label, deep
transportation:

www.deeptransportation.com 

In the near future, you will also be able
to find more information regarding NI
products, recording tips, and tutorials. 

www.recordtime.com
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